
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Gas Range Quality Features

Peerless Premier Gas Ranges are crafted with pride and made in the U.S.A. 
 

 

All Cook Tops

●     Porcelain finish top... Last longer and 
is easier to clean. 

●     Heavy Duty Grids... fixed positions... 
porcelain finish. 

●     Recessed Design... keeps spills in 
place. 

●     Lifetime Guaranteed Top Burners... 
assurance of quality and performance. 

 

 

Cook Tops (With Standard Burners)

●     Lift Off for your cleaning convenience 
●     Removable Burners... easy to remove 

and dishwasher safe 

Oven

●     Full Size Oven... extra capacity. 
●     Completely Insulated... saves energy, 

better baking. 



 

●     Keep Warm Thermostat... 150 degree 
temperature setting 

●     Baffled Oven Burner...disperses heat 
uniformly 

●     Lift Off Oven Door... all models 
except 20"... easier to clean. 

●     Heavy Duty Oven Racks... nickel 
plated with stop position. 

●     Oven Door Seals... retain heat in 
oven. 

●     Removable Oven Bottom... recessed 
area retains spills. 

●     Leg Levelers (4)... factory installed. 

 

Broiler

●     Roll-out Drop Door... easy access... 
positive closed position. 

●     Large Smokeless Pan and Tray... all 
porcelain finish 

 

Options

Chrome Heat Reflector Trays - Order 
separately when not included in the model 
number.

 

Easy Access Broiler with All Porcelain Broiler 
Pan & Tray

 
 



Exclusive Lifetime Warranty on all Top 
Burners... Your assurance of quality and 
performance. 
 
Electronic Ignition on Pilotless 
Ranges... the fully electronic spark system 
allows both oven and top burners to be lit 
with a match during power failure.

Sealed Burners... one 15,000 BTU power 
burner, two high efficiency 9,100 BTU 
burners, & one 600 to 6,000 BTU precise 
simmer burner retain spills on cook top for 
easy clean up. The EXCLUSIVE LIFETIME 
GUARANTEED top burners are 
complimented with heavy duty square grids 
for many years of enjoyable cooking. 
 
Universal Valves... On all open burner 
models allow easy conversion from Natural 
to L.P. gas without additional parts or 
special tools. Orifices for sealed burner 
models are included with range for easy 
conversion from Natural to L.P. gas.

Oven in 30" and 36" Models... A full 25" 
wide... allows more useable space.



Blade Type Control Knobs... With readily 
visible markings are easy to use.

Electronic Clock/Timer... The 12 hour 
timer is mounted in backguard with 
decorative tempered glass front... is 
conveniently set by a push of the timer 
button.
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